
Divine Mercy Sunday 
Sample Social Media Posts 

 
By the age of 45, as many as 1 in 3 women has had an #abortion. Many suffer grief, guilt and 
deep regret. May they find #healing and #peace in Christ's unending #mercy. 
hopeafterabortion.org  
 
Today the Church celebrates #DivineMercySunday. May all who have been hurt by involvement 
in #abortion receive Christ's healing mercy and peace. Jesus, we trust in you! 
hopeafterabortion.org 
 
God desires to forgive every sin, even the sin of #abortion. In fact, Jesus said to #StFaustina, 
“The greater the sinner, the greater the right he has to My mercy” (Diary, 723). God eagerly 
welcomes every repentant heart in the healing sacrament of #Confession #DivineMercySunday 
#CatholicTwitter 
 
On this #DivineMercySunday, we pray that all who fear confessing involvement in abortion be 
assured of Christ’s mercy and filled with the strength to seek it through the Sacrament of 
Reconciliation. hopeafterabortion.org  
 
May the infinite mercy of our divine Savior reach all who are suffering from participation in 
#abortion and transform them with His healing, hope, and peace. #DivineMercySunday 
hopeafterabortion.org 
 
On this #DivineMercySunday, we remember that Christ came to heal sinners. No sin is too big 
for God to forgive. Jesus, we trust in You! 
 
Today the Church celebrates #DivineMercySunday. Jesus appeared to St. Faustina, who recorded 
the Lord's messages in her Diary. Learn more about this great Feast of Mercy: usccb.org/divine-
mercy 
 
Today the Church celebrates #DivineMercySunday. Many of those who have been hurt by 
#abortion wrongly believe that it is the "unforgivable sin." But Christ longs to forgive every sin 
and never tires of offering us his pardon and peace. hopeafterabortion.org 
 
Women and men who have been involved in abortion may feel deep grief, guilt, anxiety, 
depression, and a sense of alienation from God and Church. But Christ never stops offering His 
endless mercy and peace. hopeafterabortion.org #DivineMercySunday #CatholicTwitter 
 
God's greatest desire is to forgive us, pouring out His infinite mercy upon us so that we may be 
healed. On this #DivineMercySunday, may we run to the merciful arms of Christ, who is love 
and mercy itself! usccb.org/divine-mercy 
 
St. John Paul II: "Divine Mercy! This is the Easter gift that the Church receives from the risen 
Christ and offers to humanity." May we run to the arms of Christ, who is love and mercy itself! 
#DivineMercySunday 



 
St. John Paul II: "Divine Mercy! This is the Easter gift that the Church receives from the risen 
Christ and offers to humanity." Jesus, we trust in you! #DivineMercySunday 
 
Christ desired that #DivineMercySunday would be a refuge and shelter for all souls, especially 
for poor sinners. May we always place our trust in God's infinite love and mercy for all his 
children. usccb.org/divine-mercy 
 
Did you know that Christ appeared to St. Faustina and asked that a Feast of Divine Mercy be 
celebrated? Learn more about #DivineMercySunday and Christ's unending desire to forgive all 
our sins: usccb.org/divine-mercy. Jesus, we trust in you! #CatholicTwitter 


